&-AF /E-mail: acc.compliance@epfindia.gov.in QU /Telephone : 011-26172672
e /Fax : 011-26103100
Ay Ay Y dea
HH AAEd ARG TR
Employees’ Provident Fund Organisation

(Ministry of Labour, Govt. Of India)
sy @Y saa, 14-3feeh s |, a8 Reor 110066

Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan, 14- Bhikaji Cama Place, New Delhi — 110066

www.epfindia.gov.in , www.epfindia.nic.in
No. Co-ord/3(6)2011/Amendment Scheme/ q,, Date; 28.08.2014
To '\ﬁ/{ﬂ
All Additional CPFCs (Zones) 7 8 AUG 201

All Regional PF Commissioners
In-Charge of Regional/Sub Regional Offices

Subject :  Gazette Notification on enhancement of statutory wage ceiling to Rs. 15,000/, minimum
pension of Rs. 1,000/- per month and 20% additional relief on the amount of assurance
benefit admissible under EDLI Scheme, 1976 - regarding.

Sir,
Instructions were issued vide Head Office letter dated 14.07.2014 (placed at Sl No. 268 of the circular
segment of the website), dated 23.07.2014 placed at Si. No. 289 of the circular segment of the website) and dated

01.08.2014 (placed at SI. No 311 of the circular segment of the website) wherein field offices were directed to start
preparatory activities pending issue of notification on the above subject,

2. Now, the Government of india, Ministry of Labour & Employment issued notifications enhancing statutory
wage cailing from existing Rs. 6,500/~ fo Rs. 15,000/-, fixing minimum pension of Rs. 1000/~ per menth and 20%
additional relief on the amount of assurance benefit admissible under EDLI Scheme, 1976 . The copies of the said
nofifications are enclosed herewith.

3. All the Additional CPFCs {Zones) and ail Regional PF Commissioners, In-Charge of Regional / Sub-Regional
Offices are requested to ensure implementation of the said notifications in letter and spirit.

Enclosure: As above
Yours faithfully,

A

(P. K. Udgata)
Additional Central P. F. Commissioner-l (Compliance)
Copy to
Chief Vigilance Officer
FA & CAO
All Additional CPFCs, Head Quarters.
Director (NATRSS)
All Additional CPFCs Grade-| & Grade-ll, Head Office.
Director (Audit)
Director (Official Language) for Hindi translation.
All Officers, Head Office
All RPFCs In-Charge of Zonal Training Institutes.
10. All Deputy Directors (Vigilance), Zones
11. All Deputy Directors (Audit)
12. RPFC (NDC} for web upload,

13. Web Administrator for web upload. .
14. PS to CPFC for information, M gl vy

000 NGO A WM

(P. K. Udgata)
Additional Central P, F. Commissioner-| {Compliance|



TR Ho o TRe-33004/99 REGED. NO. D. L.-33004/99

IR 2 asE

Che Gazette of Fndia

EXTRAORDINARY
A [—|0E 3—IT-TWE (i)
PART 1]—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

itk | v
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
LY ¢ T&eell, YhaN, 3T 22, 1014 /9TEW 31, 1936
No. 442]

NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 22, 2014/SRAVANA 31, 1936

% AR IR wHwa

FfergaaT
- 75 2T, 22 s, 2014

tn.w.ﬁ.sbé(ar )—wuaETd wider Ay gar wioh 3rEy oWf¥Ew, 1952 (1952 w19y HY

gRT 7 IT-URT (1) ¥ WY UTEG GO 5 T wEw ARRAT B OWEMT & BT R WA
Tagr waar ARy A agr vt svew afSfer, 1952 F s W@ g = B R
et Frear =t &, auig-

1.

(1) =T A FEArE witsy (Y (@ahm)ase, 2014 g7 ST
(2) g 01 Fasss, 2014 & wrdt grin
FHar wiasy [ dmr, 1952 %-

(%) e 2 F @Y () F IT @O (i) ¥ w2 g AT A Tiw A/ w09 S oo Cueee g
w7 7 wiRwgRe R e,

(@) NIRTE 26 F IT-A (6) H a7 @ AT AT I B wAT FT w57 vy g AR H
gtereqiie e smo;

(n) e 267 F I (2)%wﬁsm‘ﬂzwmmﬁ6ﬁ‘mﬁaﬁasﬁ
957 “Ug gOIT 79" ¥ wiaegtfig fear ammm

[#1.4. 78-35012/1/2012 waga-11]

3297G12014

m



2

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART Li—S&C. 3(i)]

=T

feroqoft:

()
(2)
3
(4)
(5)

FAT ufder @AY Fromr, 1952 feis 2 Rravay, 1052 F1 gear 9., 1500 g wRa &

T, W H, "ve 3, 39 gue (i) ¥ v & 7 o v wee e @ are 3§ Refafae
sftrgareit gy s v o -
wrar A, 584, Riw 11 7€, 1959

... 1522, Raw 16 Rawaz, 1060
gran . 201, i 8 wad), 1961
a1 %1/, 689, Raiw 19 sz, 1890
arr . 326(), R 4 7€, 2001

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 608 (E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 read with Sub-section{1} of Section 7 of the

Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme, further to amend the Emplovees’ Provident Funds Scheme. 1932, namely:-

[ ]

(1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Provident Funds (Amendment) Scheme, 2014.
(2) 1t shall come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014.

In the Eraployees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 -

(a} in paragraph 2, in clause (f), in sub-clause {ii), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the
words “ fifteen thousand rupees’” shall be substituted;

(b) in paragraph 26, in sub- paragraph (6), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupess”. the words
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(c) in paragraph 26A, in sub-paragraph (2), in the proviso, for the words “six thousand and five hundred
rupees”, wherever they occur, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

{F. No. 5-35012/1/2012-88.11]
ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl Secy,

Note:- The Employees' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 was published in the Gazette of India, Part 11, Section 3. Sub-

section (i} dated the 2nd September, 1952 vide potification number S.R.O. 1509 and the relevant paragraphs
were subsequently amended as follows:—

G.S.R. 584, dated the 11th May, 1959,
G.5.R. 1522, dated the |6th December, 1960,
G.5.R. 201, dated the 8th February, 1961.
G.S.R. 689, dated the 19th Octaber, 1990.
G.5.R. 326 (E), dated the 4th May, 2001,

WoE e 9

afgT
7% =Y, 22 &vem, 2044

q1H..609 (@) —i=reY wfyrer R gur vf sow sffrwr, 1952 (1952 # 19) N ey 7

1 34T (1) % a7 wfT awr 67 gr waw Al 1 G w0 5w e Avary adartt S A,
» 1995 & ol Foitee 7 ¥ By R dromm @t &, sraieg-

1.

(1) g FromT FHr S ("eihe) 9o, 2014 Fgamathy



[wr [[-BvE 3(i)] YR F TA9T © FEIR0 3

2

(2) %01 RBFeT, 2014 ) TuT 39% a1 § war g
FHATY F0 Ao, 1952 § (TEIIAT I AT ¥ T K #2007) -3 F 3947 2 F oigw § 7

ff 3 T 4TSRT “BY gOTTY W A TR F TT YT 4 g oY are widwdTite fE Srom

3.

TE AT F YCTE 6 % FE (%) § e qed), dd ud sl oA wedy wiey A e,

1952 ¥ 27-&" & wava "o Rrawr a7 37 Rfy v 928 g9 9T F a0 F99r 39 g o dnenia
E i

4

T qTeMT & 97 11 H -

(%) 39-T77 (1) iR 3% v ¥ P R sfemariis fvg smar, amaas-

“(4) HerT Ir Faw A offed AT Faw g S ey P S qeerar & Rad § arifte @
merT o & srafYy ¥ Far ff stwerdY safl ¥ @ §9 Y2 ¥ ane |iEA A B F el dee
wTAE &7w g o S I9g daw o frutonr 01 Prawae, 2014 3% ) 78 YA 907 d9r & o
FRTANTAS sy 9T faar srom, 9 % siftaw ag gore o viw oY oy wimg a w9
£ a3ty & R sifeaw d2g g9 svd sfemmz & sramdta &

Ford (3 frd weew Yoy @l £ gogar o 8 F Bl & 313 wmm oF B @y e
I AR TR W Fdhm P T i A e e as aw s
T 3q9 & A A 5% F g v o, 1 3w Yooy £ 9T F R Yem dreg T F w9 F A
ST,

(@) FT-47 (2) o gt S off 12 wrw” o s o WU I T A 9 v shaeae B

=

U,

() =471 (3) ¥ -
(i) < M dfw “gE R i # FRA/6500 F4Y ¥ AW O IR gAV w7
gfgeqiig frg sa

gy ogs g Ry anm
() 39-477 (3) % v, Pafafs so-d sy By sroem, anee -
“(4) 1 fifae,2014 Fr R ¥ s adwra wre o BT WA ¥ e gy g
T &Y BT wfamrg ¥ AfUE Faw F spure w0 KRt ¥ @ 4, ¥ Pl oF sl g dgw s d
wﬁw%\u&wﬁmﬁmﬁm%wwmwmwﬁmﬁﬁﬁ%WWﬁthmﬁ
T Ty 8

T B ST wEer F, Ty g w90 & A4fY aAT g 4 Rufy § o aRfw §
TTEYT et T AadT Y Mo Rt ¥ st vd e F Pro st gny X s § ¥
Ao sioraTs & &9 % 1,16 frers £ 20 § s 71 -

7ad T A 3% 57 w7 1 Raw, 2014 § =g w12 9 =ty & ofee Brp ono:

a0 7 ot 6 drfrr wiror RfY sirqes gt gempe & R el o fwa g g &
w T sty 5% ¥ 9t F39 I vty Fr @9ty o A

39 7 off & af2 3% wafy (Rwnfia vty afis), § A R W e oo @ @ e
AT S 3 e ¥ o g o & Al storaer  Frwe #7 4d) g & v o B i
T4 AT #1457 11§ i ¥ Ry R e s F i afrer B foeT F d9is ge-
mnmtﬁf&amaﬁam%ﬂﬁwﬁﬁrmﬁﬁmﬁaﬁmm’t



4 THE GAZETTE QF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY {ParT 11--8£C. 3(1))

8 o e ¥ ey 12 ¥ 9981 (2) § PR v sieia g ST A
“gord 5 39 waew A MAF Yo7 agoias smaw 9w 1 fBFas, 2014 &F Sv@ 9 dar § g
o g 9 /Y w98 9f{mTE F aftsan ¥ 9w 97 w3 ol 3@k e & sy F B dug gwre
w3 yfaorg ¥ afrFaw a9 o< Raffa $ sy

6. T3 BT 7 4 14 % o Rl o yRenfy fa srom, swa:
“14, wewy %7 iFeE Yorg ¥ Forg arr §1Y A wgd Far g o feey et arg- af Frd azer Rl
A A R o ss i frag g fimdd, kv zrsadm () ¥

e o dar 7 1 ), 9 1y Feew o W' F 7 Rfgw Fadt ars o w73 # gwww g

st 98 39 faf ot 58 a9 i suy ¢ 7 3= ¥ syemftr T F TG 96 FH T RAFew F
AT B

T B U wergTor AW ot ¥ Ry AeT Bve ¥ g IR Fa TAF da far
w= Y F I 9 T AT F W1ike ied F w9 g

OO g AT Tk AR e, i afET 9T gier, 1971 ¥ st st e & s
ey mferaT F ¥ srgaTe o Ag-Rar Agf st § w9 § wfiwfe o o @ # i
s g1 Ty stermT @ s wiree o w0

[T 5. TH-35012/1/2012-rH-1]
feroqoft.. 7 ST it Reav=w 16 7d=%, 1995 A sf¥ige dww g A R, 748(w7) g7 werfory e
a1 war Raslt art o Rats 14 weadt, 2013 R sfdgear de avar. B, 80, gror doifie fay v

qr

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd Avgust, 2014

G.5.R, 609{E}).— in exercise of powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the
Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995, namely,—

1. " (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2) 1t shall come into force on and from the |* day of September, 2014.

-

2 In the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995, (hercinafier referred to as the principal Scheme). in paragraph 3, in

sub-paragraph 2, in the proviso, for the words “rupees six thousand and five hundred”. wherever they occur, the words
“fifieen thousand rupees” shall be substinned.

-~

3. in the principal Scheme, in paragraph 6, in clause (a), after the words, figures and letter “or 27A of the

Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1932", the words “and whose pay on such date is less than or equal to fifteen
thousand rupees™, shail be inserted.

4. . Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph | 1.

(a) for sub~paragraph (1) and the proviso thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
“(1) The pensionable salary shall be the average monthly pay drawn in any manner including on piece rale basis
during contributory period of service in the span of sixty months preceding the date of exit from the mmembership
of the Pension Fund and the pensionable salary shall be determined on pro-rata basis for the pensionable service
up to the |* day of September, 2014, subject to a maximum of six thousand and five hundred rupees per month
and for the period thereafler at the maximum of fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that if a member was not in receipt of fult pay during the period of sixry months preceding the
day he ceased to be the member of the Pension Fund, the average of previous sixty months full pay drawn by

him during the period for which contribuwion 1o the pension fund was recavered, shalt be taken imo account ag
penstonable salary for calculating pension;



{ v 11-9v8 3(i}] Vit w1 T+ S| 5

(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for the figures and word 12 months”, wherever they occur, the words “sixty months”
shall be substituted, :
{c) in sub-paragraph (3),- .
(i) for the words, letters and figures “rupees six thousand and five hundred/Rs. 65007, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees”™ shalt be substituled;
(ii) the proviso shall be omitted, .
(d) after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:-
“(4) The existing metmnbers as on the 1* day of September, 2014, who at the option of the employet and
employee, had been contributing on salary exceeding six thousand and five hundred rupees per month, may on a

[resh option 10 be exercised jointly by the employer and employee continue to contribute on salary exceeding
fifieen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that the aforesaid members have to contribute at the rate of 1.16 per cent on sajary exceeding
tifieen thousand rupees as an additional contribution from and out of the contributions payable by the employees
for each month under the provisions of the Act or the rules made thereunder:

Provided further that the fresh option shall be exercised by the member within u peried of six months
from the 1" day of September, 2014:

Provided also that the period specified in the second proviso may, on sufficient cause being shown by
the memnber, be extended by the Regional Provident Fund Commissioner for a further peticd not exceeding six
months:

Provided also that il no option is exercised by the member within such period (including the extended
peried), it shatl be deemed that the member has not opted for vonwibution over wage ceiling and the
contributions to the Pension Fund made over the wage ceiling in respact of the member shall be diverted to the
Provident Fund account of the member along with interest as declared under the Emplovees’ Provident Fund
Scheme from time io time,

In the principal Scheine in paragraph 12, in sub-paragraph (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely -

“Provided that the members’ monthly pension shall be deiermined on a pro-rata basis for the pensionable
service up to the 1™ day of September, 2014 at the maximum pensionable salary of six thousand and [ive

hundred rupees per month and for the period thereafter at the maximum pensionable salary of fificen thousand
rupees per month”.

8. in the principal Scheme, for paragraph 14 the following paragraph shall be subsiituted, namely .-

14, Benefits on leaving service before being eligible for monthly member's pension.- [f a member has not
rendered the eligible service specified in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 on the date of exit, or on auaining
the 58 years of age, whichever is earlier, such member shall be entitted 1o a withdrawal benefit as laid down in
Table *D' or may opt to receive the Scheme certificate provided on the date he has not anained $8 years of age:

Provided that for ealculating such withdrawal benefit, the wages at ¢xit shall be the weighted average
of his wages at the end of every wage ceiling period:

Provided further thay an existing member shall receive additional return of contributions for his past
service under the Employees® Family Pension Scheme, 1971, computed as withdrawal-cum-retirement benefits
as per Table ‘A’ multiplied by the factor given in Table 'B* ™,

{F.No. $-35012/172012-85-11]

ARUN KUMAR SINHA,Add]. Secy.

Note: The principal Scheme was published in the Gazette of India, Extracrdinary, Part 11, Suction 3, Sub-section (i), vide
notification number G.5.R. 748 (E), dated the 16th November, 1995 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R.
BO(E) dated the t4th February, 2013.

7% Reelt, 22 s, 2014
a.F.. 610 —FiETR wiier ffy aur ofhf quay sfifres, 1952 (1952 = 19} #r
HT 7 E IT-UTT (1) F 8T A oavm 61 3ry wew R w1 v w1 5U S Aaw
AT (1 W diw A, 1976 F sk At w0 § Pre Rt drem a8 i
1 () ag T Sl R agag far (S e, 2014 sgemen
1297 4&71%-1



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY (PaRT UI—SEC. 3(5)]

2y wg 1 fadaT, 2014 ¥ ywrdt e
2. wdurdt Ry ageg I T, 1076 § (Tagydin ge9 amT F @ § gefi) o 7 F, 9w
T (1) # vag gorTe 9i &Y 798 aredl AU O iy g9 TR oreR wiReuTia R am
3. HE e ¥ s 22 %, 3wty (3) X, -
(F) §v (i) ¥, @y g O A WY e § v 97 oveg gt ST 9eR e G
(@) FfiETw ¥, ;g g ofw /Y s wedl ¥ w97 vAg g w9 a vhaewfRe G
|
4. :ﬁhﬂm ¥ dqgarr 22 #, avdaurs (3) ¥ @1g, RuEfe se-torors daenfa B oo,
a7 ;-
"(4) T o ¥ stei A &amE 22 (1), (2) A (3), Xav off g @, & wh ypeed
AT F swrar T it wiersr a3 gy s
(w16, UH-35012/1/2012 THTH-i ]
Proqufy: FaTRY PRirg-sag i drorT, 1976 Rei 28 oeT, 1976 FwT W15, 488(3) T A F
T, FATHT, 9T 01, 99 3, 39 9w (i) § v € wf ft O 37 vz § Peemr Gafim G
TAT qT:-
(hy  wnEnfR 1788, fRaiw 07.12.1976
2)  aranfr 648, = 04.05.1977
(3 wnwLfA 329, RAiw 20.02.1978
4y  wLwLfR 369, RATF 14.07.1978
(5y ®r&iR 67, fasiw 23.12.1978
(6 wLFLAL 1013, BAiw 12.09.1980
(7 wnwniR. 548, f2eiw 03.10.1981
(8) =@1#fR, 828, RAlF 14.08.1985
¢  waLfA 873, Rats 29.08.1986
(10) =r.#LR. 228, RETE 02.03.1989
(1%) ®T.%.fR, 354, fAiw 22.05.1990
(12y  =r#1fA. 30, Rmiw 28.12.1990
(13)  =FLR, 321, B 16.08.1991
(14 wnELR 420, AT 31.08.1982
(15  arFL.E. 176, 7w 07.03.1994
(16) =.F1.5. 334, RAT* 29.08.1997
(7 wFLMA. 238, BiF 13.08.2000
(18) =r.FR. 523(w), A% 18.06.2010
{19y wrFLf, 9(n), 9% 08.01.2011
20) "raEf. 83(=), RAiw 11.02.2011



-

[am - 3(i)) YR %1 TIIH : IRTURT 7

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 610 {E). —In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of
the Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following scheme further to ansend the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976, namely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2) 1t shall come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014.

2. In the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Sc'heme), in
paragraph 7, in sub-paragraph (1), for the words “six thousand five hundred rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”
shall be subsiituted.

3. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, in sub-paragreph (3).-

(a) in clause (i), for the words “six thousand five hundred rupees”, the words. “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(b} in the Explanation, for the words “rupees six thousand five hundred™, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

4. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted,

namely:-

“(4) The benefis under this Scheme shali be further increased by twenty percent in addition to the benefits
admissible under sub-paragraph (1), (2) or (3) of paragraph 22, as the case may be.”.

[F. No. $-35012/1/2012-58.11]
ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy.

Note:- The Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,

Part U1, Section 3, Sub-section (i); vide number G.8.R. 488 (E) , dated the 28" July, 1976 and subsequently amended as
follows:-

(1) GSR 1788, dated 07-12-1976
{2) GSR 648, dated 01-03-1977
(3) GSR 329, dated 20-02-1978
(4) GSR 369, dated 14-D7-1978
(5) GSR 67, dated 23-12-1978
{6 GSR 1013, dated 12-09-1980
(M GSR 548, dated 03-10-1981
(8) GSR 828, dated 14-08-1985
(9) GSR 873, dated 29-08-1986
{10} GSR 228, dated 02-03-1989
(n (SR 354, dated 22-05-1990
(12)  GSR 30, dated 2§-12-1990
(13)  GSR 321, dated 16-08-1991
(14)  GSR 420, dated 31-08-1992
(}5)  GSR 176, dated 07-03-1994
(16)  GSR 334, dated 25-08-1997
(1T GSR 238, dated 13-06-2000
{(18)  GSRS523(E), dated 18-06-2010
(19)  GSR9(E), dated 08-01-2011
(20)  GSR 83(E), dated 11-02-2011

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Dethi-110054.



et do Bro TFo-33004/99

HIXd

The Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
am [ —aUuy 3—3Y-TvY (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
wirEr | wefa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 429) =% fawel, WEETT, 3T 19, 20714/ 50FIT 28, 1936
No. 429| NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, AUGUST 19, 201 /SHRAVANA 28, 1936

g 3T T e
siftrgerr
=2 faeeil, 19 R4, 2014

are,593(30), —Frart uftey iy v weiol Sweiy ifbfram, 1952 (1952 &1 1Y) &1 90 7 A
F0-U0 (1) % WY ufEa U 6% TR WS Wiead W e w0 gy SR s SN v g, 1995 | i
o F0 & ferg Frmfafar asen a4l 2, sl -

L. (1) @z dorn wdurt Jvm W (fBd W) T, 2014 FEEna |

(2) @z 1 Toaay, 2014 ¥ woEl | shast | _

1 wEER Y ESE, 1995 (Tagedd N A e w9 0 w3 § Smrs 12 8 5 dos ()

& Iy, Frefafen v Yo Hasnfoa fea smom, aufy;-

" (7)) T8 OmE % oY et e svemn vl e deravinht ) feelt S wpa i wmer W aifees
Ay fadia 99 2014-15 & WY § O 9 ¥ F ®H T4 o0 0"

3. TE4 TR H YOuE 15 8, - 12 % 39 Y (2) 6 () § st =), v w
a1 = fag TmrE 12" TR e ow wieeni feg sl
1 HEE e F RO 16 5-

() g Y () F, @ (%) ¥, 39 @ (iv) % Iwe, Fofatas g o wafig few s,

_REGD. NO.D.L-330049

(v Y et e | fod e, afg ), ofew el fave S ofoos ww o9R v € s w, ws e
74 2014-15 % WY § sy vaow U w9 w9 w0 o
(@) FeEmE (3) ¥, @ (@) % fon, fefefas s uinefin few s, wdiE -

@) T T A Ol T SR I T T (2) g Eve %) £ Hode ds ufgy By R S wa
AT v wf Foven 1 ot OfR & 25 viawd & s i

323 GU204 (1



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY {Pary 1—8ee. 3(i}

i —

- T E T el veEn % v woR @ fg T, uf o, Wi =g i e 4 fadia o 201415 # WAy
o wfa wre & o v v @ ww W e
(m) 39 Yo (4) O, @z (%) 2 fau, Frefafes svs vt fea won, sighy -

(%) aft feame weem i Tuait e T8 g T 9 Ty oftEm ) ofoarn o s At wesiat 1= e
B s o da A W, @ A 3 Yoww (2) ¥ wvs (%) @ Fk s R S P e F 33 uf = 75 e
TiyR STE FIF W TRER B

vy w% i wRrE g ® g Ea, 3t v, Wit <prom wive sam Y frete wd 2014 15 2 W f vhew
AR § 19w w98 | wy a7 "

(¥ €. ¥E-15025/3/2007- THEE-{Lam-i]]
ot gHr Toa, st Jfae

a1z Fewror : FErl Tem i, 1995 BT 16 T, 1995 # g den w748 a) gR wefie e

o ant fygel wn o foE 14 weed, 2013 W wfkgEn dew wFLf 80(3) 3 g dai fem
0t

MINISTRY OF LABOURAND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 19th August, 2014,

(GS.R. 593 (E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6A, read with sub-section { 1) of section 7 of the
Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 {19 of 1952), the Central Governmen hereby makes
the following Scheme further to amend the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995, namely:-

I (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension (Second Amendment) Scheme, 20{4.

(2) 1t shall come into force on the 1st day of September, 2014,

2 In the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995 (hereinafier referred to as the principal Scheme), in paragraph
12, after sub-paragraph (7), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:-

“(7A) The monthly member's pensien including any relief payable to any existing or future member under this
paragraph shall not be less than one thousand rupees for the financial year 2014-15.,

3. Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph 15, for the words, brackets and figures sub-paragraphs (2) to (5) of
paragraph 12, as the case may be,”, the word and figures “ paragraph 12” shall be substituted.

4, In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 16,-

(@) in sub-paragraph (2), in clause (a), after sub-clanse (iv), the following sub-clause shall be inserted.
namely:-

“(v} in all the cases, where the monthly widow pension including refief, if any, is less than one thousand rupees

per month, the amount of monthly widow pensios in such cases shall be enhanced to one thousand rupees per
month for the financial year 2014-2015.";

(b) in sub-paragraph (3}, for clause (b), the following clanse shall be substituted, namely:-

*(b) Monthly children pension for each child shall be equal to 25 per cent of the amount admissible to the widow
of the deceased member as monthiy widow pension payable under clause (a) of sub-paragraph (2:

Provided that the minimum monthly children pension including relief, if any, for each child of the deceased
member shall not be less than two hundred and fifty rupees per month for the financial year 2014.2015.;

{c) in sub-paragraph (4), for clause {a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-



[ 1-978 3{i) ] W@ %1 AT : S 3

“(a) if the deceased member is not survived by eny widow, but is survived by children falling within the definition
of family or if the widow pension is not payable, the children shall be entitled to a monthly orphan pension equal to 75 per
cent of the amount of the monthly widow pension as payable under clause (a) of sub-paragraph {2):

Provided that the minimum monthly orphen pension including relief, il any, for each orphan shall not be less than
sever hundred and fifty rupess per month for the financial year 2014-15.",

fF. No. R-15025/3/2007.8S-1I/Pt.11}
ARUN KUMAR SINHA ,Addl. Secy.

Foot Nate.- The Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995 was published in the Gazerte of India vide notification number G.S.R.
748(E), dated the 16th November, 19935 and was lastly amended vide retification number G.8.R. 80(E), dated the

F4th February, 2013.

Piinted by the Manager, Government of Indi Press, Ring Rond, Mayapuri, New Delhi-t 10064
and Published by the Controbler of Publicatiuss, Delhi-110054



